
Colorado Secretary of State 
Jena Griswold 
1700 Broadway, Suite 550 
Denver, CO 80290 
 
 
To the Colorado Secretary of State, 
 
The amendments you’ve proposed are concerning. These amendments seem to transfer the 
authority over certain areas of the election process from local county clerks to yourself. Doing 
so promotes less transparency in Colorado’s election process. Why, for example, do you alone 
now have the authority to cancel someone’s voter registration? Why do you alone now have 
the power to investigate and prosecute any instances of a Colorado resident voting in another 
state? Why do you alone hold the power to determine the process for signature verification? 
Why are emergency ballots and requests (all of which are sent electronically) now under your 
management? After the recent scrutiny of the 2020 election, can’t you see how these changes 
could be seen as an opportunity on your part to facilitate election fraud? The timing of these 
changes is quite interesting.  
 
I’ve also noticed that the State will no longer be using Direct Recording Electronic (DRE) voting 
devices and will only be using Ballot Marking Devices (BMD). Surely you know that Dominion, 
the highly controversial voting device, can act as both. If devices that can be used as both DRE 
and BMD, how are we to know that only the BMD functionality is being used? 
 
Speaking of Dominion, I am one of many Colorado citizens who is concerned about the 
fraudulent 2020 elections (because they were fraudulent). It is a cliché at this point, but it rings 
true: if the 2020 election was a free and fair as you and many others claim, why wouldn’t you 
want to shut us up and prove us wrong once and for all by conducting a full forensic audit? I am 
calling on you to immediately conduct a full forensic audit of the 2020 elections here in 
Colorado, if only to prove to the people prior to the elections coming up in 2022 that our 
election process here in Colorado is safe and secure. 
 
The truth will come out. 
 
 
Respectfully, 
 
 
 
 
 
Brittany Salmon 
Resident of Colorado 

 


